
Multi-Input                    Controller
with serial communication
1/16 DIN - 48 x 48 mm
MF line - MC line
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Certified ISO 9001

Intelligent
The MF and MC controllers
ensure exact control under all
conditions, thanks to the
PID-FUZZY algorithm action.

Simple
PID-FUZZY parameters are
suitable for most processes;
they can, however, be easily
optimized by the launching of
automatic tuning.

Unique
With PID-FUZZY control.
With universal input for
thermocouples, Pt100, mA or
Volt, totally configurable from
keyboard. With serial
communication.
MF Series with discontinuous
outputs with relay and logic
voltage 0/18 Vdc.
MC Series with continuous
outputs 4...20 mA and
discontinuous logic voltage
0/18 Vdc.








